
A Career Built on Mentorship
Donald’s hospitality journey began with a simple 
philosophy: say yes. Early on, he took every opportunity 
others avoided, covering doubles, stepping into empty 
roles, or arriving early when asked. “I never asked about 

Managing Two Resorts as 
One Community
Overseeing Living Water Resort & Spa and Living Stone 
Golf Resort requires agility and teamwork. Staff are 

never slips,” Donald explains.

From a revenue standpoint, the model is smart; guests are 

pancy.

But more than efficiency, Donald emphasizes culture. 
Whether guests choose Living Water for wellness or Living 
Stone for golf and family fun, they experience the same 

dining, to the golf course, create the sense of one resort 
family.

His openness earned him valuable mentorship, 

reshaped Donald’s view of leadership. “Larry showed me 

driving results; it’s about leading with compassion, 

for.”

Living Water Resort & Spa and Living stone Golf Resort. 
With a career built on mentorship, resilience, and servant 

excellence with genuine care.

Donald sees hospitality evolving in four major ways: 

sustainability.

Guests now expect more than a room; they want the 
comforts of home with resort benefits. Living Water’s 
condos offer full kitchens, living areas, and waterfront 
views, a perfect fit for families and long-stay visitors. 
Seasonality is embraced, with summer golf and marina 

and wellness programs in the fall and spring.

Technology plays a growing role with online check-in, AI 
tools for guest insights, and seamless booking systems. 
Meanwhile, sustainability remains central: solar panels, EV 

on-site in the resort’s greenhouse.

bility,” Donald says. “Our job is to deliver all three.”
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their room looked like, but they never forget how we 
made them feel,” Donald says.

That same philosophy extends to his team. During the 
pandemic shutdown, salaries were topped up to 90% 
before relief programs began, and a Caring Fund support-
ed employees in need. Staff lunches, BBQs, and access to 
chaplain and counselling services reinforce a culture 
where people come first.

People First:

“When staff feel valued and part of a community, they 

Larry Law, he adds: “You can be profitable and kind.”

community where seniors can live alongside families who 
already gather at the resort.

about building a lifestyle rooted in wellness, family, and 
belonging,” Donald explains. Residents will enjoy resort 

It’s a bold step toward redefining hospitality as not just 
short-term stays, but lifelong community building.

Living Water Retirement Residence

open to mentorship, lead with heart, and never lose sight 
of people.

“Too many leaders chase numbers and forget that hospi-
tality is about people,” he says. “If you put staff, guests, 
and community first, the numbers will follow.”

constantly. If you can embrace new tools while leading 
with empathy, you’ll be the kind of leader hospitality truly 
needs.”

team culture, Donald Buckle embodies a style of leader-
ship that proves hospitality is about more than rooms and 
revenue; it’s about belonging. At Living Water Resorts, he 

Advice to Future Leaders


